
Breauna O. Crumpler is a Vice President and Private Client Advisor II at Bank of America
Private Bank based in Buffalo, New York. She works closely with clients to address a
range of wealth management needs. She leads a team of Private Bank specialists who
work in concert to design and implement tailored financial strategies in investment
management, trust and estate planning services, liquidity-event preparation, lending,
and philanthropy.

Breauna is passionate about helping families and business owners reach their financial
goals. Prior to joining Bank of America Private Bank (formerly U.S. Trust) in 2019, she
served as a Small Business Banker in Seattle, Washington, an experience which
enhanced her insight into the wealth management needs of business owners and their
families in a major growth market.

Breauna is deeply dedicated to effecting positive community change. In 2016 she
chartered the Seattle Chapter of the Black Professional Group at Bank of America to
encourage associates to give back to the community they serve while simultaneously
investing in themselves through professional development in order to achieve upward
mobility within the company. Since relocating back to Buffalo, she joined Bank of
America's leadership council within LEAD for Women, the Career Development Event
Coordination Team, and the Private Bank and Upstate NY's Diversity & Inclusion Council.
Breauna continues to spend much of her time volunteering throughout the city, building
community through her actions. She is both a member of the Board of Trustees, as well
as the Advancement and Diversity Committee, at Explore & More-The Ralph C. Wilson,
Jr. Children's Museum.

Additionally, she is a member of the Board of Trustees, the Women's Economic Mobility
and the ALL-IN Committee, for the WNY Women's Foundation, and she also serves on
the board for SUNY Erie's Foundation. In 2022, Breauna was featured in Buffalo
Business First and The Buffalo News for her hard work and effort in the community.

Breauna holds a B.S. in sociology and an MBA. She is a member of the National Black
MBA Association.


